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Richard Bateman 
Richard Bateman obtained his degree in Pharmacy from the University of Wales in 1989. He has held 
a number of Production and Quality Assurance Management roles in UK Hospitals. Since 2001 he has 
been a Regional Quality Assurance Specialist Pharmacist in East and South East England Specialist 
Pharmacy Services. He is a member and former Chair of the NHS Pharmaceutical Quality Assurance 
Committee. 
 
Alison M. Beaney 
Alison Beaney obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Sunderland a M.Sc. in 
pharmaceutical analysis from the University of Strathclyde and a Doctorate on the topic of 
preparation and manufacture of medicines. She has worked in the NHS in hospital pharmacy for all of 
her career and is Regional Quality Assurance Specialist Pharmacist for the North East of England. She 
is currently Vice Chair of the national NHS Pharmaceutical Quality Assurance 
 
Willem Boeke 
Willem Boeke obtained his degree in pharmacy (speciality: Pharmaceutical Technology) from the 
University of Groningen in 1977. He has worked at hospital pharmacies in Emmen (NL) and Hengelo 
(NL) and directed several projects for (re-) building pharmaceutical production facilities. 
 
Anne Haaije de Boer 
Anne Haaije de Boer is a process engineer who started working for the Department of 
Pharmaceutical Technology and Biopharmacy of the University of Groningen in 1973. He is the 
founder and research leader of the inhalation group of that department since 1990, which developed 
the basic concepts for the marketed Novolizer, Genuair and Twincer dry powder inhalers. 
 
Frits Boom 
Frits Boom obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Groningen in 1973. He worked in 
the Slotervaart hospital pharmacy (Amsterdam) being responsible for the preparation of sterile and 
non-sterile medicines. In 1982 he became director of pharmacy of Zaans Medical Centre in Zaandam. 
He was one of the authors of the GMP-Hospital pharmacy in the Netherlands and also published 
many articles on the subject of small scale preparation. He retired in 2014 but is still active in the 
field of aseptic handling. 
 
Roel Bouwman 
Roel Bouwman obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Utrecht in 1981. After a start 
in the military pharmacy, he has worked at Ratiopharm Netherlands as Qualified Person and to date 
he is Qualified Person/QA director for the Central Hospital Pharmacy of The Hague. 
 
Yvonne Bouwman-Boer 
Yvonne Bouwman-Boer obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Amsterdam in 1972. 
She has worked since then at the Laboratory of the Dutch Pharmacists (LNA) in The Hague in the field 
of pharmacy preparation: research, helpdesk, formulations, guidelines, legislation, occupational 
safety and health and policy. 
 
Tessa Brandsema 
Tessa Brandsema obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Groningen in 2005. She 
has worked for 2 years in a pharmacy in Hengelo and for 7 years in a cooperation of four pharmacies 
in Enschede. To date she works as a pharmacist in the hospital pharmacy in Almelo. 
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Sin Ying Chuah 
Sin Ying Chuah obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Utrecht in 2009. She works at 
the Royal Dutch Pharmacists Association (KNMP), department the Laboratory of Dutch Pharmacists 
(LNA). 
 
Sylvie Crauste-Manciet 
Sylvie Crauste-Manciet obtained her degree in Pharmacy (PharmD) in 1993, her PhD on 
nanoemulsion formulation in 1997, and obtained her accreditation to supervise research, (HDR) in 
2013 from the University of Paris Descartes, France. From 1999 she combined hospital pharmacy in 
the field of hospital preparations, academic activities as an associate professor in pharmaceutical 
technology and research in the field of formulation of nanovesicles for therapeutic and imaging. She 
is currently at University Hospital of Bordeaux, in the pharmaceutical technology and research 
laboratory ARNA., she has been president of GERPAC since 1998. Her interests have been in sterile 
compounding, controlled areas such as isolators and in the chemical risks for operators involved in 
the preparation of cytotoxic medicines. 
 
Jan Dillingh 
Jan Dillingh obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Groningen in 2004. He works at 
the production department of the Central Hospital Pharmacy (Dept. of Clinical Pharmacy and 
Pharmacology) of the Groningen University Hospital. His interests encompass the development of 
new products and (aseptic) processes, including investigational medicinal products. 
 
Hans van Doorne 
Hans van Doorne obtained his degree in chemical engineering from the Delft Technical University in 
1971. In 1977 he obtained his PhD at the Leiden University on the microbiological quality of topical 
pharmaceutical preparations. From 1985 until 2012 he worked as a microbiologist at the department 
of Pharmaceutical Technology of the University of Groningen. For 20 years he was the Dutch 
representative and finally Chairman of Group 1 (microbiology) of the European Pharmacopoeia until 
his retirement in 2014. 
 
Suzy Dreijer 
Suzy Dreijer obtained her degree in pharmacy in 1971 from the University of Leiden. She has worked 
as a teacher at the universities of Leiden and Utrecht. From 1989 until her retirement in 2011 she has 
combined working at the Laboratory of Dutch Pharmacists (LNA) and in a community pharmacy. 
 
Ernst Eber  
Ernst Eber obtained his degree in medicine (MD) from the University of Graz in 1985. He is Professor 
of Paediatrics and to date Head of the Respiratory and Allergic Disease Division at the Department of 
Paediatrics and Adolescent Medicine of the Medical University of Graz. 
 
V’Iain Fenton-May 
V'Iain Fenton-May obtained his pharmacy degree from the University of Bradford in 1972 from 
where he moved into hospital pharmacy. He was the Quality Control pharmacist for the hospitals in 
Wales from 1974, until his retirement in 2007. During the latter years he also managed the Central 
non-sterile manufacturing and procurement department for the Welsh hospitals. Subsequently he 
was an independent consultant and QP for industry, he has chaired the British Pharmacopoeia 
Commission for 3 years and chair of the BP Unlicensed Medicines expert group, he was the head of 
the UK delegation to the European Pharmacopoeia Commission until end 2013 and is currently the 
Chairman of the Ph.Eur. expert groups for microbiology (Group1) and Pharmaceutical Preparations.  
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Erik Frijlink 
Henderik W. Frijlink studied pharmacy at the University of Groningen. He performed research on the 
biopharmaceutical aspects of cyclodextrins and received his PhD in Pharmaceutical Technology in 
1990. He was head of the pharmaceutical development department at Solvay Pharmaceuticals, until 
he became Professor in Pharmaceutical Technology and Biopharmacy at the University of Groningen 
in 1998. The current topics of his research include pharmaceutical and biopharmaceutical aspects of 
systems for pulmonary drug delivery and products for targeted oral drug delivery.  
 
Monja Gantumur 
Monja Gantumur obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Zagreb in 1999. She has 
worked at public pharmacies and to date she is pharmacist in the Children' s hospital at the 
University Hospital Center Rijeka in Croatia. In 2009 she obtained postgraduate specialisation of 
analysis and control of medicinal products. 
 
Stineke Haas 
Stineke Haas obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Groningen in 1976. She has 
been teaching pharmaceutical preparation at the same University until her retirement in 2012. 
 
Anita Hafner 
Anita Hafner obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Zagreb in 2000. Since then she 
has been working at the Department of Pharmaceutics of the same University, currently as assistant 
professor. She obtained her master degree in 2003 and PhD degree in 2008, both in Pharmaceutical 
sciences and focussed at design and development of innovative micro/nanosystems for nasal drug 
delivery. 
 
Minna Helin-Tanninen 
Minna Helin-Tanninen obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Kuopio in 1995. She 
has worked at the Kuopio University Hospital in Finland with pharmaceutical preparation as main 
responsibility. In 2014 she obtained her Ph D on the preparation of paediatric oral formulations. 
 
Wouter Hinrichs 
Wouter Hinrichs studied chemistry at the University of Groningen and received his PhD degree at the 
University of Twente in 1993. After several post-doctoral fellowships at the University of Twente and 
the Utrecht University, He has been assistant professor at the Department of Pharmaceutical 
Technology and Biopharmacy of the University of Groningen since 1998.  
 
Helena Jenzer 
Helena Jenzer obtained degrees as a pharmacist from the Swiss Confederation in 1984, as doctor of 
pharmacy from the University of Bern in 1987, and as hospital pharmacist from FPH (Foederation 
Pharmaceutica Helvetiae) in 2001. She ha more than 25 years of practice experience in leading 
positions at Bern University Hospital Inselspital and at cantonal teaching hospital Fribourg. From 
2011 on, she became full-time reader and head of research in nutrition and dietetics at Bern 
University of Applied Sciences. She is a member of EAHP Scientific Committee. 
 
Adrie de Jong 
Adrie P. de Jong obtained his degree in pharmacy at the University of Amsterdam in 1976 and 
obtained his Ph.D in 1981 at the same University. After a short stay as a research fellow at the 
University of Connecticut (USA) he gathered 15 years of GMP experience in various leading functions 
in the pharmaceutical industry. From 1997-2006 he contributed as an expert in various GMP projects 
in two major hospital pharmacies. Since 2006 he has been a radiopharmacist at the Department of 
Nuclear Medicine at the hospital of Alkmaar, The Netherlands. 
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Irene Krämer 
Irene Krämer obtained her degree in pharmacy and her doctoral degree from the  Johannes 
Gutenberg-University in Mainz, Germany in 1982 and 1986, respectively. Since 1991 she has held the 
position as Director of Pharmacy in the University Medical Center Mainz. In 1999 she finished her 
postdoctoral thesis and in 2006 was appointed as Professor for Clinical Pharmacy at the faculty of 
Pharmacy, Johannes Gutenberg-University Mainz.  
 
Rogier Lange 
Rogier Lange obtained his Pharm D degree from the University of Amsterdam in 1985. He has worked 
at hospital pharmacies in Amsterdam and Nieuwegein. Now he is hospital pharmacist at Meander 
Medical Centre in Amersfoort. His main responsibilities are GMP, radiopharmacy, (haemato)oncology 
and nuclear medicine. He is currently working on a PhD thesis on the development and application of 
the bone-targeting therapeutic radiopharmaceutical Rhenium-188-HEDP. 
 
Paul Le Brun 
Paul Le Brun obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Groningen in 1982. He has 
worked at the Laboratory of Dutch Pharmacists (LNA), Merck Sharp&Dohme and to date he is 
Director of Production for the Central Hospital Pharmacy of The Hague. In 2001 he obtained his PhD 
on the improvement of antibiotic inhalation for CF patients. 
 
Antje Lein 
Antje Lein obtained her degree in pharmacy from the Martin Luther University Halle-Wittenberg in 
1998. Since 2001 she has been staff member of the Pharmaceutical Laboratory of Deutscher 
Arzneimittel-Codex/Neues Rezeptur-Formularium in Eschborn, Germany. She is head of the 
DAC/NRF-information service and works on the development of pharmacy preparations and their 
publication.  
 
Andrew Lowey 
Andrew Lowey obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Bradford in 1999. He has 
worked at Airedale General Hospital, Harrogate District Hospital & Leeds Teaching Hospitals in a 
number of roles in both clinical and technical disciplines in pharmacy. In 2007, he obtained his 
(D.Pharm) for research into the quality and formulation of unlicensed medicines in the UK. He is 
currently the Lead Clinician for Clinical Pharmacy & Technical Services at Leeds Teaching Hospitals 
 
Annick Ludwig 
Annick Ludwig obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Ghent in 1970 and her PhD 
from the University of Antwerp in 1979. After working a few years at a city hospital pharmacy she 
started an academic career at the University of Antwerp. She retired as professor of Pharmaceutical 
Technology and Biopharmacy in 2012. Her main research topic was ocular drug formulation. 
 
Bengt Mattson 
Bengt Mattson obtained his PhD degree in polymer chemistry from the Royal Institute of Technology 
in 1993. He has worked at Pharmacia/Pfizer with environmental management since 1994 in several 
positions. Since 2012 he works part-time at LIF, the association for the research-based 
pharmaceutical industry in Sweden, as Policy Manager focusing corporate responsibility and 
environmental matters. 
 
Stefanie Melhorn 
Stefanie Melhorn studied pharmacy and at the TU Carolo-Wilhelmina Braunschweig, Germany. In 
2009 she received her PhD from the Department of Pharmaceutical Technology of the same 
University. Since then she works in the editorial department of the Neues Rezeptur-Formularium in 
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Eschborn, editing the DAC/NRF, developing formulations, and taking part in a helpdesk on questions 
on pharmaceutical preparation. She gives presentations on different preparation topics. 
 
Lilli Møller Andersen 
Lilli Møller Andersen obtained her masters degree in Pharmacy in 1982. After 5 years in hospital 
pharmacy she had positions at Novo Nordisk A/S for 17 years, with a profound experience on Quality 
Assurance and GMP. Since 2009 she works at the hospital pharmacy of Region Hovedstadens Apotek, 
and to date she leads major projects on facilities, equipment and management systems. In 2006 she 
obtained a masters degree in Psychology of Organisations. 
 
Olga Mučicová 
Olga Mučicová obtained her degree in pharmacy from the Charles University, Prague in 1993 and in 
1997 her 1st postgraduate degree in pharmacy from The Institute for Postgraduate Education in 
Health Care, Prague. She worked in industry and as head of the Sterile Preparations Department of 
Masaryk's Hospital pharmacy in Ústí nad Labem, Czech Republic. Currently she is Chief Pharmacist of 
that pharmacy. 
 
Shi Wai Ng 
Shi Wai Ng obtained her degree in pharmacy from the Utrecht University in 2009. She is working as a 
research pharmacist at the Laboratory of Dutch Pharmacists (LNA). She has special interest in 
adapting oral medicines and occupational safety and health. 
 
Christien Oussoren 
Christien Oussoren obtained her degree from University Utrecht in 1990. In 1996 she obtained her 
Ph.D on the subcutaneous administration of liposomes to target to the lymphatic systems. To date 
she is associate professor at the department of Pharmaceutics of Utrecht University.  
 
Giovanni Pauletti 
Giovanni M. Pauletti was trained as a pharmacist at the Swiss Federal Institute of Technology in 
Zürich (Switzerland) and obtained his PhD degree in biopharmaceutics/pharmacokinetics from the 
same institution in 1993. After a postdoctoral fellowship at the University of Kansas (U.S.A.), he 
began his academic career at the Texas Tech School of Pharmacy in 1997. Today, he is at the 
University of Cincinnati, Winkle College of Pharmacy (U.S.A.) where he also serves as Director of the 
Graduate Program in Pharmaceutical Sciences. 
 
Mattias Paulsson 
Mattias Paulsson obtained his pharmacist degree from Uppsala University in 1997. He has worked as 
a formulation scientist at Cederroth International and Fresenius Kabi R&D as well as head of the 
aseptic preparation unit at the Uppsala University hospital pharmacy. Currently he is a hospital 
pharmacist. In 2001 he obtained his PhD on the controlled release of drugs from aqueous polymer 
gels for mucosal drug delivery. 
 
João Pinto 
João F. Pinto graduated in Pharmaceutical Sciences (Industry) (MPharm) from the University of 
Lisbon in 1987. He served in the Portuguese Army as a Pharmacist before he got his Master of 
Science (MSc) in 1989 and his PhD in 1994 in Pharmaceutics and Pharmaceutical Technology from 
The School of Pharmacy, University of London. Since then he has been working at the University of 
Lisbon as an Assistant and Associate Professor. 
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Doerine Postma 
Doerine Postma obtained her degree in pharmacy from the University of Groningen in 2003. She is 
working at the Laboratory of Dutch Pharmacists (LNA) since then, where she focusses on the 
shortages and preparation of medicines. 
 
Marco Prins 
Marco Prins obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Amsterdam in 1981. He has 
been head of pharmaceutical production departments and radiopharmacist in several hospital 
pharmacies and senior consultant for industrial GMP. Currently he is head of hospital pharmacy in 
Uden, head of radiopharmacy services in ‘s-Hertogenbosch, The Netherlands and head of Quality 
Assurance and Qualified Person in a Nuclear Cardiology Imaging Company. 
 
Holger Reimann 
Holger Reimann obtained his degree in pharmacy from the Freie Universität Berlin in 1980 and his 
PhD in Pharmaceutical Technology from the University of Düsseldorf in 1986. He has worked at the 
Central Laboratory of German Pharmacists (ZL) and to date he is head of the NRF Pharmaceutical 
Laboratory in the department DAC/NRF (Neues Rezeptur-Formularium/Deutscher Arzneimittel-
Codex) at Govi-Verlag, Eschborn. 
 
David Roesti 
David Roesti is a global expert in microbiology for Novartis Pharmaceuticals and is currently leading 
the global microbiology network of Novartis Pharma and the Rapid Microbiological Methods team at 
Novartis Pharma AG in Stein, Switzerland. David holds a PhD in microbial ecology from the University 
of Neuchâtel, Switzerland and has 15 years of experience in the field of microbiology within various 
domains.  
 
Hans van Rooij 
Hans van Rooij obtained his degree as a pharmacist at the University of Amsterdam in 1972. He 
obtained his PhD in 1980. His broad experience includes topics in pharmaceutical analysis, licensing 
of radiopharmaceuticals, pharmacovigilance and quality management. Currently, he is an 
independent consultant and Qualified Person (QP). 
 
Mark Santillo 
Mark Santillo obtained his degree in Pharmacy from the University on Nottingham in 1985 and has 
worked within the National Health Service ever since, specialising in Quality Control, Quality 
Assurance and Research and Development, becoming a Regional Quality Assurance Officer in 2007. 
 
Anthony Sinclair 
Anthony Sinclair is Director of Pharmacy at Birmingham Children’s Hospital and holds an Honorary 
Visiting Chair at Aston University. He is a Fellow of the Royal Pharmaceutical Society (RPS) and also of 
the Faculty of the RPS and a member of the Scientific Committee of EAHP, who he has represented at 
EDQM and EMA events and a member of the Health Education England Pharmacy advisory group. 
Interests include Healthcare delivery systems, safety and paediatric medicines. 
 
Oscar Smeets 
Oscar Smeets obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Utrecht in the Netherlands in 
1985. He is manager of the Laboratory of Dutch Pharmacists (LNA), a department of the Royal Dutch 
Pharmacists Association (KNMP). He has specialised on pharmaceutical analysis, external auditing 
and laboratory quality management. 
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Jan de Smidt 
Jan de Smidt studied pharmacy in 1978 at Utrecht University and worked there as a teacher 
afterwards as well as a policy adviser for science and education at the Royal Dutch Pharmacists 
Association (KNMP). He is initiator and still actively involved in the KNMP’s Special Interest Group for 
Philosophy and Ethics on the basis of his studies in academic philosophy 1976-1983. He obtained his 
PhD in 1990 on the diffusion model in dissolution kinetics. 
 
Julian Smith 
Julian Smith obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of London in 1982. He has been a 
hospital pharmacist working in Quality Assurance for the majority of his professional career. 
Currently he is a Director in his own company Viridian Pharma. He is a Qualified Person in the 
pharmaceutical Industry. In 1997 he obtained his PhD in transdermal drug delivery. 
 
Hana Šnajdrová 
Hana Šnajdrová obtained her degree in pharmacy from the Charles University in 1996. She has 
worked at Hospital Pharmacy in Provincial hospital in Tábor. To date she is Head of Pharmacy at 
Thomayer hospital in Prague. 
 
Alexandra Staerk 
Alexandra Staerk studied hygiene technology at the technical University of Sigmaringen. Since 1995 
she’s working at Novartis Pharma AG (former Sandoz AG) in Switzerland. In her function as Head of 
QA/QC Microbiology department she leads microbiological isolator qualification, defining media fill 
standards and Rapid Microbiological Methods. 
 
Małgorzata Sznitowska 
Małgorzata Sznitowska obtained her degree in pharmacy from the Medical University of Gdansk, 
Poland, in 1984. She is a Head of Department of Pharmaceutical Technology in that University, 
teaching pharmacy students and performing research in the field of pharmaceutical technology and 
pharmaceutical practice. 
 
Daan Touw 
Daan Touw obtained his degree in pharmaceutical sciences from the State University of Leiden in 
1984. He has worked in hospital pharmacies and obtained his PhD in 1996, on the optimisation of 
tobramycin treatment of patients with Cystic Fibrosis. At present he is head of the laboratory of the 
department of Clinical Pharmacy and Pharmacology and professor in Bioanalysis, Therapeutic Drug 
Monitoring and Clinical Toxicology in the University Medical Center Groningen in the Netherlands. 
 
Marija Tubic Grozdanis 
Marija Tubic Grozdanis did her PhD thesis in Pharmaceutical Technology at the Johannes Gutenberg 
University in Mainz, Germany in 2007. She was involved in the application of gastrointestinal 
simulations programs to deciphering drug absorption. Since 2008 she has been head of the 
Department for Clinical Trial Supply in Johannes Gutenberg-University Medical Center in Mainz. 
 
Jean Vigneron  
Jean Vigneron obtained his degree in pharmacy and D.Pharm from the University of Nancy, France, in 
1982. Since 1985, he worked in the University Hospital of Nancy and is currently responsible of the 
production of cytotoxic drugs. He has created the European database Stabilis® in 2001 and is 
president of the nonprofit INFOSTAB association. 
 
Herman Vromans 
Herman Vromans studied pharmacy in Groningen where he also obtained his PhD degree 
(pharmaceutical technology). Subsequently he worked in the pharmaceutical industry for more than 
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20 years. Since 2000 he has been professor pharmaceutical technology & biopharmaceutics at the 
University of Utrecht. 
 
Rik Wagenaar  
Rik Wagenaar obtained his degree in pharmacy from the University of Utrecht in 1990. He worked in 
community pharmacy and from 1993 he has been employed at the Laboratory of Dutch Pharmacists 
(LNA). His main field of interest is the Quality Control of pharmacy preparations. Recently he has 
been involved with the formulation of professional guidelines about dispensing of medicines and 
preparation of medicines in community pharmacies. 
 
Herman Wijnne 
Herman Wijnne obtained his degree in pharmacy and his Ph.D on multivariate statistics from the 
University of Amsterdam. He has a long-time experience as a consultant and teacher at the 
Universities of Amsterdam and Utrecht. Presently he is a registered biostatistician and a freelance 
consultant in applied statistics. 
 
Herman Woerdenbag  
Herman Woerdenbag obtained his degree in pharmacy in 1984 and in 1988 his PhD from the 
University of Groningen. He worked at the University of Groningen as researcher and lecturer at the 
Department of Pharmaceutical Biology and later as policy advisor for research and education for the 
Pharmacy institute. Since 2008 he has been senior lecturer at the Department of Pharmaceutical 
Technology and Biopharmacy.  

 


